
 

  
 

Azerion Group publishes its 2024 Annual Report  
 

Amsterdam, 24 April 2025 - Azerion Group N.V. (EURONEXT:AZRN) today published its 
audited Annual Report for the financial year ended December 31, 2024. The 2024 Annual 
Report has been filed with the Dutch Authority for the Financial Markets (the AFM) and is 
available at www.azerion.com/reports/ as a PDF file as well as in the ESEF (European Single 
Electronic Format) and HTML format. 
 
The Annual Report confirmed the preliminary Full Year 2024 unaudited financial figures 
published on 28 February 2025 with revenue of €551.2 million and Adjusted EBITDA of €75.1 
million in line with 2024 guidance.  
 
The audited net loss of €(56.0) million differs from the preliminary unaudited financial figures 
(net loss €(35.4) million). This variance relates to the non-recurring accounting treatment 
associated with contingent earn-out conditions from the 2023 social card games portfolio 
divestment. The final disputed amount of the outstanding earn-out receivable as well as the 
anticipated due date could not be reasonably assessed at this moment. As a result, the Group 
restated the original financial asset of €21.9 million to €0 as of 31 December 2024 and any 
potential positive outcome from this dispute would improve the future net result of the Group. 
 
Group 2025 guidance remains unchanged. 2025 revenue is expected to be in the range of 
approximately €600 million to €650 million and Adjusted EBITDA is expected to be at least 
approximately €85 million. 
 
About Azerion 
Founded in 2014, Azerion (EURONEXT: AZRN) is one of Europe’s largest digital advertising 
and entertainment media platforms. Azerion brings global scaled audiences to advertisers in 
an easy and cost-effective way, delivered through our proprietary technology, in a safe, 
engaging, and high-quality environment, utilizing our strategic portfolio of owned and operated 
content with entertainment and other digital publishing partners. 
  
Having its roots in Europe and with its headquarters in Amsterdam, Azerion has commercial 
teams based in 21 cities around the world to closely support our clients and partners to find 
and execute creative ways to make a real impact through advertising. 
  
For more information visit: www.azerion.com 
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Disclaimer 

This communication is for information purposes only. The information contained in this 

communication does not purport to be full or complete and, in particular, is not intended to form 

the basis of any investment decision. No reliance must be placed by any person for any 

purpose on the information contained in this communication or its accuracy, fairness or 

completeness. Azerion is not liable for any loss or damages of any nature ensuing from using, 

trusting or acting on the information contained in this communication 


